
LEVEL TWO: RECONCILIATION 

MESSAGE 
(Knowledge of the Faith) 

WORSHIP 
(Liturgy) 

CHRISTIAN MORALITY 
COMMUNITY 

(Service) 

1.  God is the Creator of life. 
         - He created us in His image, to  
           love as He does. 
         - He loves with a "covenant   
           love" (with commitment,  
           faithfulness). 
         - God’s love helps me to use  
           my entire self to grow in love  
           for God and neighbour. 
 

2.  We belong to God’s family, the  
     Church. 
         - Through Baptism, we become  
           members of the Church and  
           are called to be disciples of  
           Jesus. 
         - Being a disciple means being  
           a faithful friend to Jesus, who  
           loves us as a best friend.  It  
           also means being a friend to  
           all, as Jesus was. 
         - God asks us to do our best in  
           our relationships (faithfulness  
           and commitment). 
 

3.   "Covenant love" means we  
       make choices as Jesus would. 
         - God gave us the gift of  
           freedom, so that might make  
           good choices. 
         - We develop habits which  
           either help (virtue) or hurt (sin)  
           others as well as ourselves. 
         - Rules help us to develop good  
           habits.  They help us to keep  
           our promises.  They keep us  
           safe, happy, and loving. 

 
 Prayer: Our Father.  Attention 

words: 
        - trespasses (wrongdoing) 
        - temptation (something that  
          may be attractive, but leads  
          us to do wrong) 

 
 Mass focus: 

             -  In the Penitential Rite, we  
                pause to remember the  
                times that we have made  
                choices that have hurt  
                ourselves or others.  We  
                ask God’s forgiveness.  
                ("Lord, have mercy...") 
             - At the Sign of Peace, we  
               make peace to show that  
               we are willing to forgive  
               others, as Jesus fogave us.   
               He showed this in His  
               willingness to die to redeem  
               us from our sins. 
 

 Prayer: Confiteor (" I confess 
to Almighty God...").  Focus: 

       - Sin hurts not only ourselves,  
          but others around us. 
       - Sin consists not only in  
          doing something wrong.   
          We might also sin in our  
          thoughts, or in failing to do  
          something good when the  
          was an opportunity.  
 

 
 The First Commandment: 
      Nothing should be more  
      importnat than God in our  
      lives. 

 
 The Second Commandment: 
     We speak God’s name with  
     reverence and respect. 
 
 The Third Commandment 

reminds us that the Church is 
Christ’s Body.  We come 
together to worship as a 
community.  We participate in 
the Church’s prayer, the 
Sacred Liturgy.   

 
 The Fourth Commandment: 

God  wants us to respect, obey, 
and care for our parents.  He 
also wants us to respect all 
rightful authority. 

 
 The Fifth Commandment: We 

must respect all life, because 
all life comes from God.  We 
protect life, our own and that of 
others, and show special care 
for unbrin babies, the elderly, 
those with disabilities, and 
those who are sick. 

 
 

 
 As a class, take part at the 

Parish Sunday Mass, by 
leading the Penitential Rite. 

 
 Make a photo collage of sin in 

the world, and discuss how 
wrong choices hurt others.  
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4.  Reconciliation is celebrating  
     God’s forgiveness. 
         - Learning how to forgive  
           begins in our family. 
         - Sin is choosing to turn away  
           from God and his family. 
         - We can always ask  
           forgiveness from God and  
           others when we fail to do our  
           best in our relationships. 
 

5.  God is faithful, even when we   
     are not. 
         - In the Sacrament of  
           Reconciliation, we experience  
           God’s forgiveness. 
         - God will always forgive, as  
           long as we are truly sorry. 
         - We show that we are truly  
            sorry when we try not to sin  

             again. 

 
 Prayer: Act of Contrition. 

 
 The Rite of Reconciliation. 
 

 
 The Sixth Commandment: 
      We respect the covenant of  
      the Sacrament of Marriage.   
      We honor and are faithful to  
      family life.  We respect God’s  
      gift of sexuality. 

 
 The Seventh Commandment: 
     We respect what belongs to  
     other and the resources taht all  
     people depend on. We share  
     with those in need.  We work  
     for justice and "human rights". 
 
 The Eighth Commandment.  

We are honest and truthful.  
Gossip and false accusations 
have no place among God’s 
people.   

 
 The Ninth Commandment: 

Married people belong to one 
another in a special way.  It is 
sinful to try to destroy the 
special relationship of a 
married couple, or try to 
destroy a marriage bessed by 
God. 

 
 The Tenth Commandment: We 

are not jealous of what others 
have.  We are not greedy.  We 
rejoice in others’ good fortune, 
and help them in hard times. 

 
 Discuss the things that break 

up unity (in our families and in 
the Church).   

 
 Practice how to ask for 

forgiveness and how to forgive 
others. 

 
 Pray for those who make 

choices that hurt others. 
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           long as we are truly sorry. 
         - We show that we are truly  
            sorry when we try not to sin  

             again. 

 
 Prayer: Act of Contrition. 

 
 The Rite of Reconciliation. 
 

 
 Attention words: 
        - A sin is a choice we make  
          to do something that will   
           hurt our relationship with  
           God, with ourselves, or with  
           others. 
        - A mistake is something we  
          may have done, but did not  
          intend to do. 
        - Contrition is the feeling of  
          being sorry for choosing to  
          do wrong. 
 
 As disciples of Jesus, we ask 

forgiveness when we make 
choices that hurt our 
relationship with God and 
others. 

 
 As disciples of Jesus, we also 

forgive those who hurt us. 

 
 Discuss the things that break 

up unity (in our families and in 
the Church).   

 
 Practice how to ask for 

forgiveness and how to forgive 
others. 

 
 Pray for those who make 

choices that hurt others. 
 

 


